NAKALA MTANDAO (ONLINE DOCUMENT)

THE UNITED REPUBLIC OF TANZANIA

[ ASSENT,

ENACTED by the Parliament of the United Republic of Tanzania.

1. This Act may be cited as the Pension Laws (Miscellaneous Amend-  Short title

ments) Act, 1991, and shall come into operation on the 1% day of April, 29 com-
1991 ‘ . mence-
* ment

2. The various laws set forth in the first and second columns of the Amend-
Schedule to this Act are hereby amended in the manner specified in the 'c“ef_:‘;m of
third column. written

laws



NAKALA MTANDAO (ONL

INE DOCUMENT)

2 Neo.7 Pension Laws (Miscellaneous Amendments) 1991
SCHEDULE
CoLumMN 1 COLuMN2 COLUMN 3

Acts 1981 Pensions (Laws Miscellaneous Amendments) Section 9 is amended in respect of paragraph (b) of Regulation 23(1)

No.15 by deleting the words “twelve and one half” and substituting the words
fifteen and one half”.

Acts 1989 Pensions Laws (Miscellaneous Amendments) Section 9 is amended in respect of paragraph (c) of Regulation 23(1)

No.4 by deleting the words “seven thousand two hundred” and substituting
the words “eighteen thousand”. .

Acts 1981 Pensions Laws (Miscellaneous Amendments) Section 13 is amended in respect of paragraph (b) of Regulations

No. 15 13A(1) by deleting the words “twelve and one half” and substituting
the words “fifteen and one half”.

Acts 1989 Pensions Laws (Miscellaneous A d ) Section 19 is amended iln‘respect of paragraph (c) of Regulation 13(1)

No.4 by deleting the words “seven thousand two hundred” and substituting
the words “eighteen thousand”.

Acts 1981 Pensions Laws (Miscellaneous A dments) Section 16 is amended in respect of paragraph (b) of Regulation 11(1)

No. 15 by deleting the words “twelve and one half” and substituting the words
fifteen and one half”.

Acts 1989 Pensions Laws (Miscell A d ) Section 22 is amended in respect of paragraph (c) of Regulation 11(1)

No.4 by deleting the words “seven thousand two hundred” and substituting
the words “eighteen thousand”.

Acts 1981 Political Leaders Pensions Act Section 11(1) is amended at paragraph (b) by deleting the words

No. 14 “twelve and one half” and substituting the words fifteen and one half”

Acts 1989 Pensions Laws (Miscellaneous Amendments) Section 11(2) is amended at paragraph (c) by deleting the words “seven

No. 4 thousand two hundred” and substituting the words “eighteen
thousand”.

Cap.51 Section 5 is amended by deleting the words “one twelfth” and sub-

Provident Fund (Government Employees)
Ordinance

stituting the words “ten per centum”.

Section 6 is ded by deleting the words “each deposit” and sub-
stituting the words “fifteen percentum of the depositor’s monthly
salary”.




NAKALA MTANDAO (ONLINE DOCUMENT)

P

No. 7 Pension Laws (Miscellaneous Amendments) 1991 3
SCHEDULE—(contd.)
Cout
UM CoLumn2 CoLumn 3

Acts 1986 Specified State Leaders Retirement Benefits Section 13(1) is amended at paragraph (b) by deleting the words “one

No.2 hundred and twenty-four thousand, two hundred shillings” and sub-
stituting the words “one million two hundred thousand shillings”.

Cap.371 Pensions Ordinance Section 11 is repealed.

Acts. 1986 Specified State Leaders Section 17(4) is amended by deleting the words “four hundred and
thirty-three thousand, three hundred thirty-three shillings and
thirty cents” and substituting the words “six hundred sixty-six
thousand six hundred sixty-six shillings and sixty-five cents”.
Section 18(4) is amended by deleting the words “three hundred
and _twenty-five thousand” and substituting the words “five
hundred thousand”.

G.N. 1965 Unified Teaching Service (Pensions and Gratu- Regulation 12A is repealed.

No. 304 ities) Regulations

G.N.1968 Defence Forces (Service Pension and Gratuities) Regulation 14 is repealed.

No. 52 Regulations.

78 . 3
Qf,t 113 Parastatal Pensions Scheme Ac. Section 36 isrepealed.
Act 1981 Political Leaders Pensions Act Section 16is repealed.

No. 14



4

No. 7

NAKALA MTANDAO (ONLINE DOCUMENT)

Pension Laws (Miscellaneous Amendmcm)‘ — | 1991

Passed in the National Assembly on the tenth day of. April, 1991,

-----------------------------------------

Printed by the Government Printer, Dar es Salaam, Tanzania





